
Subject: RE: Purchase Contract , 6220
From: <sylvia.yang@sumitomocorp.com>
Date: 26/04/2024, 14:41
To: <dyah@paneragroup.com>
CC: <robbin.robbin@sumitomocorp.com>, <ramdhan@paneragroup.com>,
<sbudinata@paneragroup.com>, <sunny.goh@sumitomocorp.com>

Dear Pra�wi

As far as I am aware, we do not possess a VAT license. Instead, please u�lize our GST Registra�on Number:
M2-0099343-8.

Best Regards
Sylvia
DID: 6530 0933

From: Dyah Putri Pra�wi <dyah@paneragroup.com>
Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 3:27 PM
To: Yang Sylvia [Sumitomo Corpora�on Asia & Oceania Pte. Ltd., Singapore Head Office]
<sylvia.yang@sumitomocorp.com>
Cc: Robbin Robbin [PT. Sumitomo Indonesia Jakarta Head Office] <robbin.robbin@sumitomocorp.com>;
ramdhan@paneragroup.com; sbudinata@paneragroup.com; Goh Sunny [Sumitomo Corpora�on Asia & Oceania
Pte. Ltd., Singapore Head Office] <sunny.goh@sumitomocorp.com>
Subject: Re: Purchase Contract , 6220

Dear Sylvia,

Thank you for your email, I have received for the PO. Could you please provide us with your VAT
License for the necessary documenta�on for our new customer.

The goods are now in prepara�on, will inform further for delivery.

Thank you.

--
Best regards,
Dyah Putri Pra�wi
Business Development
Email : dyah@paneragroup.com
Mobile: +62 822 8148 8742
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